
Sconce Wall Pair Tin Shaped Cresting Washington's Headquarter's
Rockingham

£2,700
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REF: 11449 

Height: 37 cm (14.6") 

Width: 11 cm (4.3") 

Depth:  6.5 cm (2.6") 

Description

Surviving pieces of vernacular lighting are extremely rare and it is hard to source convincing re-creations. A
recreation of an historic sconce from Rockingham House, George Washington's Headquarter's Rockingham
NJ. with a plausible antiqued patina.

Tapering single candle, tin wall sconce with shaped cresting and antiqued patina. Electrified with Girard
Sudron candle lamps.

Height - 37cm., 14 1/2" Width - 11.5cm., 4 1/4" Depth - 6.5cm

Rockingham is believed to be the second oldest house in the Millstone River Valley, its original rooms built
about 1710. The house was originally a two-story, two-room frame house with a one and one-half story lean-
to at its back, situated high on a rocky hillside above the river. The house and about 100 acres were
purchased by 1735 by John Berrien, who later served as Somerset County Judge, Trustee for the College
of New Jersey (present day Princeton University), New Jersey Supreme Court Justice and Colony
Assemblyman. He greatly enlarged the house for his growing family in the 1760s and added land gradually
to total over 360 acres, making it a substantial farm appropriate for a prosperous, well-established man. In
June of 1783, a small number of Pennsylvania troops of the Continental Army, not having received their
back pay for almost a year, went into revolt and marched upon Philadelphia. Congress removed
themselves to Princeton, New Jersey, after being assured of New Jersey's protection. Elias Boudinot,
President of the Continental Congress, called upon General George Washington to send a loyal
detachment of troops to Philadelphia which Washington did. In late July, Congress requested the General's
presence in Princeton. Washington was in Newburgh, New York, near West Point with the remains of the
standing army. Until he received the message and was able to reply, it was August. When accommodations
were sought for Washington and his retinue at that time, there was little still available for a short-term stay.
The only suitable home sat four miles away and belonged to the widow of John Berrien. Mrs. Margaret
Berrien (who was living in a townhome in Princeton and had Rockingham up for sale) agreed to rent
Rockingham and furnishings to the General and his entourage on a monthly basis. On August 23rd of 1783,
General Washington, accompanied by his wife, three aides-de-camp, a small guard of two to three dozen
soldiers including dragoons (the equivalent of military police today), and "domestics" (servants and slaves),
took up residence. The General would ultimately stay there over two and one-half months from late August
to early November. It must have been a pleasant stay with Rockingham's varied orchards and spacious
grounds, although Mrs. Washington was ill at times and, due to winter approaching, returned to Mount
Vernon in early October. Washington entertained frequently including Congressmen such as James
Madison and Elias Boudinot, military personnel such as General Benjamin Lincoln, Revolutionaries Robert
Morris ("Financier of the Revolution") and Thomas Paine, and local acquaintances such as Annis Stockton
(widow of Declaration of Independence signer, Richard Stockton) and the Van Hornes. He hosted at least
one party with nearly two-hundred guest...
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